

AGENDA

ACI 308 Curing Concrete

Wednesday, October 28, 2020 – 1300-1600 EDT

Virtual – UTC-4

Meeting Room: Virtual – Log onto ACI event page once registered

(<https://event.crowdcompass.com/acif20>)

1.01 Introductions

- Virtual format due to COVID-19 restrictions

1.02 Approval of Fall 2019 Cincinnati Meeting Minutes

1.03 Membership

1.04 TAC Dates

Activity	ACI Fall Convention Virtual October 25-29, 2020	ACI Spring Convention Baltimore, MD March 28-April 1, 2021	TAC Summer Meeting Coeur d'Alene, Idaho July 14-16, 2021
Final 30-day letter ballot issued	June 29, 2020	November 20, 2020	March 12, 2021
Committee-approved document submitted to staff for editorial review	July 24, 2020	December 24, 2020	April 16, 2021
Document submitted to TAC and external reviewers	September 18, 2020	February 19, 2021	June 11, 2021
TAC Review Group conference calls	October 14-16, 2020	March 17-19, 2021	July 7-9, 2021
TAC meeting	October 23-24, 2020	March 27-28, 2021	July 14-16, 2021

1.05 Recent Committee Activities and Correspondence

- 310-308 TG2 Curing of Decorative Concrete Update – David Hoyt

1.06 ASTM Activities

- 1.07 Update on 308-A, Curing-Guide Activities: Ron Kozikowski/Josh Carroll
- 1.08 Update on 308-B, Curing-Specifications Activities: Erik Holck
 - Discussion and resolution of negative on most recent ballot
- 1.09 Update on Curing TechNote: Larry Taber
- 1.10 Update on Retaining Heat of Hydration TechNote: Larry Taber/Oscar Antommattei
 - Future of document – timeline to resolve negatives or consider shelving
- 1.11 ACI Foundation’s CRC research sponsorship: Larry Taber on Advisory Committee
 - Dr. Mehdi Khanzadeh’s ongoing research titled “Determination of the Curing Efficiency of Externally and Internally Cured Concrete Using Neutron Radiography”
- 1.12 What’s New in Curing Concrete?
 - Short presentations or photos for the good of the committee are welcome! (email taberlh@bv.com for easier sharing on virtual meeting)
- 1.13 Old Business
- 1.14 New Business
- 1.15 Adjournment

Schedule:

2020 Fall Convention
Virtual – UTC-4 (Eastern Daylight Time)

<u>Committee No.</u>	<u>Committee Name</u>	<u>Day</u>	<u>Time</u>
310-308 TG2*	Curing Decorative Concrete Task Group	Tuesday	1200-1300
308-B	Curing-Specifications	Tuesday	1900-2030
308-A	Curing-Guide	Wednesday	1100-1300
308	Curing Concrete	Wednesday	1300-1600

* Joint Committee Meeting